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Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org> Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:30 PM

To: Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com>
Emily,
| was not able to put together the fee for the project today. | will get you this information on Monday.

Wes

Wes Pringle. P.E.

Transportation Engineer
Metro Development Review

Los Angeles Department of Transportation

213.972.8482 W f o

LADOT

TERTEEEEEEEE TR ConfidentialityNotice TEERTEETEEEE R

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of Transportation, which may

be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of this
information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and
any attachment

without reading or saving in any manner.

Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:46 PM

To: Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org>

Monday is fine. Thanks Wes! Have a good weekend!

Sent from my iPhone
[Quoted text hidden]

Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org> Mon, May 16, 2016 at 3:30 PM

To: Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com>
Emily,
The review fee will be $25,000 and the expediting fee will be $4,903.88.

Wes
[Quoted text hidden]

Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> Mon, May 16, 2016 at 3:36 PM

To: Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=f6ce74f7d4&view=pt&cat=Hollywood%20Crossroads&search=cat&th=154a785904a92a46&sim|=154a785904a92a4. ..
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Thanks, Wes!

From: Wes Pringle [mailto:wes.pringle@lacity.org]
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 3:31 PM

To: Emily Wong

Subject: Re: Hollywood Crossroads Review Fee

Emily,

The review fee will be $25,000 and the expediting fee will be $4,903.88.

Wes

On Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:46 PM, Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> wrote:

Monday is fine. Thanks Wes! Have a good weekend!

Sent from my iPhone

On May 12, 2016, at 5:31 PM, Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@]acity.org> wrote:

Emily,

| was not able to put together the fee for the project today. | will get you this information on Monday.

Wes

Wes Pringle.
P.E.
Transportation
Engineer

Metro Development
Review

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=f6ce74f7d4&view=pt&cat=Hollywood%20Crossroads&search=cat&th=154a785904a92a46&sim|=154a785904a92a4... 2/13
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Los Angeles
Department of
Transportation

213.972.8482

o Confidentiality Notice*** Hok -

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of
Transportation, which may be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of
this information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original
message and any attachment

without reading or saving in any manner.
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Confidentiality Notice

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of Transportation, which may
be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of this
information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and
any attachment

without reading or saving in any manner.

Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> Thu, Jun 2, 2016 at 9:49 AM
To: Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org>
Cc: Sarah Drobis <SDrobis@gibsontrans.com>

Hi Wes,

Can we please set up an online payment for this Project?

Thank you,

Emily

From: Wes Pringle [mailto:wes.pringle@lacity.org]
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 3:31 PM

To: Emily Wong

Subject: Re: Hollywood Crossroads Review Fee

Emily,

The review fee will be $25,000 and the expediting fee will be $4,903.88.

Wes

On Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:46 PM, Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> wrote:

Monday is fine. Thanks Wes! Have a good weekend!

Sent from my iPhone

On May 12, 2016, at 5:31 PM, Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org> wrote:

Emily,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=f6ce74f7d4&view=pt&cat=Hollywood%20Crossroads&search=cat&th=154a785904a92a46&sim|=154a785904a92a4... 5/13
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| was not able to put together the fee for the project today. | will get you this information on Monday.

Wes
Wes Pringle.
P.E.
Transportation
Engineer
Metro Development
Review
[ Image
removed by
sender. Los Angeles
Department of
Transportation
! mage 213.972.8482
removed by
sender.
L1 |
| | —
[ Image
removed by
sender.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=f6ce74f7d4&view=pt&cat=Hollywood%20Crossroads&search=cat&th=154a785904a92a46&sim|=154a785904a92a4... 6/13



3/2/2017 City of Los Angeles Mail - Hollywood Crossroads Review Fee

I

***************************Confidentiality NotiCe************************************

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of
Transportation, which may be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of
this information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original
message and any attachment

without reading or saving in any manner.

Wes Pringle.
P.E.
Transportation
Engineer

Metro Development
Review

Los Angeles
Department of
Transportation
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***************************Confidentiality NotiCe************************************

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of Transportation, which may

be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of this
information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and

any attachment

without reading or saving in any manner.

Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org> Fri, Jun 3, 2016 at 3:22 PM

To: Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com>
Cc: Sarah Drobis <SDrobis@gibsontrans.com>

Hi Emily,

To make an online payment, please use the following information:

¢ Invoice No. 805543
e Amount: $29,903.88
o Staff: Wes Pringle

Please make sure you pick my name as the staff person so that | receive an email that payment was made.

For online payment instructions please go to: http://ladot.lacity.org/how-do-i/how-do-i-make-online-payment/developer-
fees

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=f6ce74f7d4&view=pt&cat=Hollywood%20Crossroads&search=cat&th=154a785904a92a46&sim|=154a785904a92a4. ..
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[Quoted text hidden]

Wes Pringle. P.E.

Transportation Engineer
Metro Development Review

100 S. Main Street, 9th Floor
Los Angeles, CA 90012

Los Angeles Department of Transportation

213.972.8482 W f O

LADOT

FrRRRsesseseeeeeseese Confidentiality Noticg ™ ** ity

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of Transportation, which may
be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of this
information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and

any attachment
without reading or saving in any manner.

Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> Fri, Jun 3, 2016 at 4:23 PM
To: Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@]acity.org>
Cc: Sarah Drobis <SDrobis@gibsontrans.com>

Thanks Wes!

From: Wes Pringle [mailto:wes.pringle@lacity.org]
Sent: Friday, June 03, 2016 3:22 PM

To: Emily Wong

Cc: Sarah Drobis

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]
Transportation
Engineer

Metro Development
Review100 S. Main
Street, 9th FloorLos
Angeles, CA 90012
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il et Confidentiality Notice*  ******** e

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of Transportation, which may
be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of this
information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and
any attachment

without reading or saving in any manner.

Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> Mon, Jun 6, 2016 at 3:18 PM
To: Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@lacity.org>
Cc: Sarah Drobis <SDrobis@gibsontrans.com>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=f6ce74f7d4&view=pt&cat=Hollywood%20Crossroads&search=cat&th=154a785904a92a46&sim|=154a785904a%2a... 10/13
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Hi Wes,

| tried to send the traffic study over via e-mail, but the file was too large, so you will be receiving a hard copy of the
report with a CD of the electronic copy.

Thank you,

Emily

From: Wes Pringle [mailto:wes.pringle@lacity.org]
Sent: Friday, June 03, 2016 3:22 PM

To: Emily Wong

Cc: Sarah Drobis

[Quoted text hidden]
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***************************Confidentiality Notice************************************

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of Transportation, which may
be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of this
information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and
any attachment

without reading or saving in any manner.

Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@]acity.org> Wed, Jun 15, 2016 at 8:01 AM
To: Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com>
Cc: Sarah Drobis <SDrobis@gibsontrans.com>

Hi Emily,
Yes, we have received the study. However, the review fee has not been paid.
Thanks,

Wes
[Quoted text hidden]

Wes Pringle. P.E.

Transportation Engineer
Metro Development Review

100 S. Main Street, 9th Floor
Los Angeles, CA 90012

Los Angeles Department of Transportation

213.972.8482 W f O
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Confidentiality Notice

This electronic message transmission contains information from the Los Angeles Department of Transportation, which may
be confidential. If

you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the content of this
information is prohibited. If

you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and

any attachment
without reading or saving in any manner.

Emily Wong <ewong@gibsontrans.com> Wed, Jun 15, 2016 at 8:04 AM
To: Wes Pringle <wes.pringle@]acity.org>
Cc: Sarah Drobis <SDrobis@gibsontrans.com>

Wes,

Thank you for the update. We will coordinate with the Project team.

Thanks,

Emily

From: Wes Pringle [mailto:wes.pringle@lacity.org]
Sent: Wednesday, June 15, 2016 8:02 AM

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]
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